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Alameda County Tax Defaulted Land

Treasurer-Tax Collector

Public Auction Results - March, 15 2008 - March 18, 2008

item Num Parcel Number Site Minimum Bid Results of Auction
17 99A-1900-8-4 GREENVILLE RD, LIVERMORE 1,278.00 Sale Not Consumated
34 41-4148-59 1020 70TH AVE, OAKLAND 90,722.00 No Bid
39 417-292-23 THURSTON CT, HAYWARD 1,669.00 Sale Not Consumated
56 45-5369-17 10575 TOPANGA DR, OAKLAND 152,623.00 No Bid
94 44-4951-6-1 9029 INTERNATIONAL BLVD, OAKLAND 9,975.00 120,100.00
102 45-5369-12-6 306 105TH AVE, OAKLAND 115,120.00 No Bid
104 4-101-7 531 CHESTER ST, OAKLAND 8,236.00 41,600.00
108 6-23-24 1730 9TH ST, OAKLAND 11,020.00 91,800.00
111 6-35-69 1775 CHASE ST, OAKLAND 9,838.00 25,100.00
112 7-586-25 3240 HANNAH ST, OAKLAND 29,863.00 35,200.00
132 26-785-8 2547 E 27TH ST, OAKLAND 85,327.00 No Bid
136 29-989-13-3 COOLIDGE AVE, OAKLAND 9,216.00 54,100.00
138 29-1015-80 4253 LAGUNA AVE, OAKLAND 46,621.00 Sale Not Consumated
164 41-4166-46 856 70TH AVE, OAKLAND 7,758.00 120,100.00
174 45-5314-12 26 MALTA CT, OAKLAND 16,864.00 80,000.00
176 45-5369-18 10585 TOPANGA DR, OAKLAND 27.483.00 110,201.00
178 46-5480-9-9 9053 HILLSIDE ST, OAKLAND 11,836.00 100,201.00
217 5-452-10-2 MARKET ST, OAKLAND 55,716.00 No Bid
219 43-4553-20 1452 85TH AVE, OAKLAND 37.403.00 91,800.00
224 15-1306-22-1 1077 57TH ST, OAKLAND 128,550.00 No Bid
225 40-3396-6 7533 MACARTHUR BLVD, OAKLAND 112,524.00 No Bid
227 44-5009-8 9630 WALTER AVE, OAKLAND 247,922.00 No Bid
229 5-453-4 2941 MYRTLE ST, OAKLAND 240,025.00 No Bid
233 39-3251-22 1701 CHURCH ST, OAKLAND 70,753.00 No Bid
234 2-61-61 324 10TH ST, RM 204, OAKLAND 64,934.00 Sale Not Consumated
235 5-429-5 1021 24TH ST, OAKLAND 156,672.00 No Bid
236 9-692-5 804 27TH ST, OAKLAND 236,235.00 No Bid
237 4-93-24 1556 8TH ST, OAKLAND 91,411.00 No Bid
238 6-13-42 1005 CAMPBELL ST, OAKLAND 260,704.00 No Bid
239 6-23-20 905 WILLOW ST, OAKLAND 185,368.00 No Bid
240 44-4954-16 9114 B ST, OAKLAND 144,141.00 No Bid
241 4-61-10 1424 12TH ST, OAKLAND 136,871.00 No Bid
242 4-93-27 1562 8TH ST, OAKLAND 142,280.00 No Bid
243 5-434-24 1034 24TH ST, OAKLAND 151,306.00 No Bid
244 6-21-33 1731 CHASE ST, OAKLAND 165,622.00 No Bid
245 42-4267-28 1063 87TH AVE, OAKLAND 61,443.00 No Bid
246 38-3215-25 1725 62ND AVE, OAKLAND 212,460.00 No Bid
248 3-13-12 834 ATHENS AVE, OAKLAND 213,746.00 No Bid
249 6-23-15 925 WILLOW ST, OAKLAND 122,724.00 No Bid
250 45-5254-9 10545 PIPPIN ST, OAKLAND 161,996.00 No Bid
251 41-4148-19 1027 70TH AVE, OAKLAND 183,991.00 No Bid
253 5-435-13 1076 24TH ST, OAKLAND 144,292.00 No Bid
254 40-3396-5 7525 MACARTHUR BLVD, OAKLAND 200,587.00 No Bid
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256 4-75-22 1488 3RD ST, OAKLAND 171,149.00 No Bid
257 40A-3418-27 73RD AV, OAKLAND 51,689.00 No Bid
258 6-27-2 1745 14TH ST, OAKLAND 247,593.00 No Bid
260 9-710-2 3041 WEST ST, OAKLAND 148,239.00 No Bid
261 12-965-21-1 3700 WEST ST, OAKLAND 350,432.00 No Bid
262 7-554-9 1616 15TH ST, OAKLAND 183,552.00 No Bid
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